From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacationfwgmail.com>
To: Richard Kahn <[
Subject: Re: Invoice

Date: Tue, 04 Nov 2014 21:36:21 +0000

try to negotiate but pay

On Tue, Nov 4, 2014 at 5:24 PM, Richard Kahn *f_ wrote:
current order 1s for trees (@ 8 for $200 each
previous orders were trees (@ 15 for $275 each
please advise if ok to proceed
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBEK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel
fa
ce

Begin forwarded message:

From: Daphne Wallace <[ -

Subject: Fwd: Invoice
Date: November 4, 2014 at 2:51:08 PM EST
To: Rich Kahn < =, ann rodriguez < =
Greetings Rich,
For your review and payment via wire:
(30) PR Palms (@ $200 per palm = $6,000
(1) Phyto certificate = 50
56,050
They are booked to sail this Friday, November 7, 2014,

Please advise, DW
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————————— - Forwarded message ------—-—--—-

From: Moraima Quintana </ -

Date: Tue, Nov 4, 2014 at 2:38 PM
Subject: Invoice

To: Daphne Wallace

Ce: Ingnd Rivas < =
Hello!

Here is your invoice for the palms of this week.
Regards,

Moraima

Your message is ready to be sent with the following file or link attachments:

201411041528.pdf

Note: To protect against computer viruses, e-mail programs may prevent sending or receiving certain types of

file attachments. Check your e-mail security settings to determine how attachments are handled.

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential. may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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