
From: Alireza Ittihadieh  

To: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>, Ivjet  

Subject: RE: BBJ 

Date: Wed, 05 Nov 2014 17:35:08 +0000 

Nothing FANS-1 due till 2020 

From: Jeffrey E. [mallto:jeevacation@gmaii.com] 
Sent: Wednesday, November 5, 2014 1:16 PM 
To: Alireza Ittihadieh; Met 
Subject: Re: BB) 

put a term sheet together please . so there is no misunderstanding. 25 now. anything i get for 727 is his. what 
upgrades are needed , new cpdp for translantic crossing etc. 

On Wed, Nov 5, 2014 at 8:16 AM, Alireza Ittihadieh > wrote: 
Dear Jeff, 

I am in Switzerland with the owner of the BBJ and he has Agreed to $25M now and Balance in a note upon the 
sale of 727. 

Please advise if you are interested in proceeding. 

As ever. 

V-BR 
Alireza ITTIHADIEH 
President & Chief Executive 
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