) - ton(@gmail.com=
Ce:

Subject: !e:

Date: Wed, 22 Nov 2017 16:38:18 +0000

The only discussion, by email, was about shifting the distribution from one grandchild to another. Valeria will
send you the correspondence. No other authorization in writing, and | have no recollection of verbal
authorizations.

We're still trying to clarify the alleged distributions to me from the marital accounts. According to Deborah,
these were to pay our taxes. We received no notification of this, and so far haven't been able to find out, from the
accountant, whether our payment of taxes was correspondingly reduced. We wrote to ask him 12 days ago, but
no response yet.

I wrote to the three children about authorizing Max to step down as trustee of the marital trusts.

On Wed, Nov 22, 2017 at 8:45 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation/@gmail com=> wrote:
did you authorize the gifts to grandchildren . if so how. 1n writing?
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