
From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To

Subject: Re: 
Date: Wed, 22 Nov 2017 16:41:55 +0000 

once harry and max stetp down , all will be ok. my concern is that this is where the rubber meets the road . 
with regard the 529 accounts , not sure if there was resolution.? the amounts from the trust say were for 
taxes and paid directly to the Us treasury. that is unusual. as the treasury is not a benificiary. normally it would 
have been paid to noams account alone. 

On Wed, Nov 22, 2017 at 11:38 AM, Noam Chomsky < > wrote: 
The only discussion, by email, was about shifting the distribution from one grandchild to another. Valeria will 
send you the correspondence. No other authorization in writing, and I have no recollection of verbal 
authorizations. 

We're still trying to clarify the alleged distributions to me from the marital accounts. According to Deborah, 
these were to pay our taxes. We received no notification of this, and so far haven't been able to find out, from 
the accountant, whether our payment of taxes was correspondingly reduced. We wrote to ask him 12 days ago, 
but no response yet. 

I wrote to the three children about authorizing Max to step down as trustee of the marital trusts. 

On Wed, Nov 22, 2017 at 8:45 AM, Jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 
did you authorize the gifts to grandchildren . if so how. in writing? 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 

EFTA01001839



communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

EFTA01001840


