
From: Richard Kahn 

To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: Jeffrey Epstein - Hurricane Damage to Fine Art & Jewelry - USVI - Claim #610421 - 
McLarens File #008.021055.00 - WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

Date: Thu, 02 Aug 2018 19:31:39 +0000 

Attachments: doc03427920180802132835.pdfi 08.021055.00_Epstien_Inventoty.pdfi 
doc03364420180713174721.pdf 

attached is correspondence from Leah who is an adjustor hired by AIG to review fine arts and jewelry claim filed 

on 1st PDF below i have marked up Leah's attachment (2nd PDF) 
below is an overview of where she currently is in resolving our claim 

Total items ready to be solved immediately via partial settlement 
on my attachment- green) 
Total items that more information is needed 
attachment - purple) 
Total items that she needs to investigate if they are appropriate with our policy 
attachment - white) 

1,102,339 (sum of A 

609,325 (sum of B on my 

227,467 (some of . on my 

Regarding tomorrow call with Leah at 10:30am: 

she will call you (as required) at 

call will be recorded and then leah will print transcript which you will have to then sign and notarize 

leah explained sole purpose of the call was the 4 loose diamonds and patek watch that was lost when the kite 
house blew away 
(all of diamonds are on pages 28-36 of 3rd PDF at the bottom of this email) 

anna explained to leah on her site visit that the 4 diamonds and watch were in your kite house jewelry box along 
with patek watch. 
anna also explained that each of your bedrooms had a jewelry box 
leah asked why loose diamonds were not secured and anna explained that no one other than anna was allowed in 
your personal 
space and probably all employees had no idea they were even there. 

anna explained that diamonds were at that location as you contemplated making a piece of jewelry for your 
girlfriend.. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New 22 
tel 
fa 
cell 
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Begin forwarded message: 

From: Leah Hutton 
Subject: Jeffrey Epstein - Hurricane Damage to Fine Art & Jewelry - USVI - Claim #610421 -
McLarens File #008.021055.00 - WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
Date: July 27, 2018 at 3:23:56 PM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn 

Dear Rich, 

Further to our phone discussion earlier this week, we are returning a copy of the claim inventory with our comments 
specifying the additional information we need to identify the destroyed and discarded items better. 

We also added color coding to the list. The items shaded green are items we believe will be easiest to resolve based on 
the information you recently provided. We suggest trying to address the outstanding information on these items first 
(note many of these items require action from our side). Once we have the details for the green items, we should be in a 
position to request a partial settlement. 

The items that have no color coding are items still lacking substantive descriptions. If the photographs you have already 
provided depict any of these items, please let us know. 

For the items highlighted in purple, Mclarens needs to demonstrate to the carrier these objects meet the definition of 
fine art under the policy. The policy defines fine arts as "paintings, etchings, statuary and other bona fide works of art, 
historical value or artistic merit". It is particularly important to supply as much information as possible about the 
creators or manufacturers of these items. 

Please let me know if you have any questions. 

Kind regards, 

Leah Hutton I McLarens 
Executive General Adjuster 

1 Battery Park Plaza 
24 State Street 
New York, New York 10004 USA 

office 
mobile 
fax 

www.mciarens.com 

CONFIDENTIALITY AND PRIVILEGE NOTICE: e information contained in this message and any attachments may be 
ivilebto, Lori' lueniial ano/ur tikes np, disclosure under applicable law. Any views expressed in this message and 

any attachments are those of the individual sender, except where the message states otherwise, and in no way binds 
Insurers and/or their representatives. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any use, 
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dissemination, distribution or reproduction of any information contained herein or attached is strictly prohibited. If you 
have received this email in error, please immediately notify the sender and destroy the original transmission and its 
attachments, without reading them. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein - Hurricane Damage to Fine Art & Jewelry - USVI - Claim #610421 
- McLarens File #008.021055.00 
Date: July 13. 2018 at 6:55:35 PM EDT 
To: Leah Hutton 

attached is summary along with invoices / backup for the majority of the items with hopefully more to come... 
please review and lets discuss monday. 
i am available all day so please advise on best time to call you 
thank you and have a nice weekend 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York NY 10022 
tel 
fa 
cell 
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