
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@grnail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn • 

Subject: Re: Zorro Water Development 
Date: Thu, 02 Aug 2018 20:08:49 +0000 

ok 

On Thu, Aug 2, 2018 at 4:08 PM, Richard Kahn • > wrote: 
Brice has been working with Casey Cook in order to achieve 68 acre feet by November 1, 2019 under Permit 
E7871 
Note as of date Zorro has achieved 50% of this amount 

The proposed plan to meet the conditions of the Permit is to apply water to existing grass lands within the 20 
acres for grazing of the livestock 
Brice has not put together a comprehensive budget but estimated total costs would be approximately $125,000 

Please advise on the two proposals Brice would like to proceed with: 

I) Water Reel Irrigation System - $17,565 

Brice proposed buying one unit now to run with existing pumps and pipe as a test.. 
Then during the next few months Brice would work with Casey to design and install 
new piping system to support 2 units for the 2019 irrigation season 

http://kifco.corn/OurProducts/Water-Reels/B-SeriesWater-Reels/tabid/102/language/en-US/Default.aspx

2) Replacement of the VFD for well pump in Well B - $13,589 

In 2015 the well pump for Well B was upgraded to 50 gpm 3 phase motor and in so a single phase 7.5hp 3 
phase VFD was installed 
Brice says that the existing VFD is very susceptible to voltage fluctuations and currently needs to be reset 
daily.. 
Brice expressed that this situation has made it very difficult to achieve a constant water supply for domestic 
and irrigation purposes.. 
Brice proposes having RMC Electric install a new VFD with 25hp vs current 7.5hp drive which he believes 
will allow it to handle the 
power fluctuations from the power company 

Please advise 
Thank you 
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Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
NeiiMM2 
tel 
fax 
cell 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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