
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@grnail.com>

To 
Subject: Re: 

Date: Thu, 02 Aug 2018 20:27:13 +0000 

paypal 500 

On Thu, Aug 2, 2018 at 4:26 PM  wrote: 
She will be back to Lithuania on Sunday and will start the applicaiton. How much and would you like to do 
PayPal or bank wire? 

On Thu, Aug 2, 2018 at 1:40 PM jeffrey E. leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 
tell her we will pay for her to try to get a tourist visa. 

On Thu, Aug 2, 2018 at 1:03 PMa.. wrote: 
I just chatted with again and she told me that she had been deported from LA before: "Because 
they interviewed me and then took my phone and found out that I've got money for shooting and doing 
promotional work as I said in Miami while I was with esta only. But it's okay I didn't get a ban or 
anything, I just need to do normal visa next time" 
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