
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation®gmail.com> 
To: Paul Barrett

Subject: Re: FW: Updates 
Date: Fri, 13 Jul 2018 14:09:04 +0000 

Inline-Images: image002.jpg; image003.jpg 

yes 

On Fri, Jul 13, 2018 at 9:56 AM, Paul Barrett

Regarding #1 — can we officially tender? 

Paul Barrett 

Alpha Group Capital LLC 

From: Paul Barrett 
Sent: Monday, July 09, 2018 7:47 PM 
To:''effre jeei ng: mail.com> 
Cc: 
Subject: Updates 

Jeffrey 

> wrote: 

I. Can we officially accept the FMURoche tender at $137/share in cash? 
2. I bought $IMM of the Exela bonds at $102.875 (9.12% yield). Will work another $1MM at a $102.50. 
3. SPY calls closed at $2.73. We paid $1.55. I am still holding them. 
4. Nothing done yet on Interactive Corp. Will let you know when I buy. 

Paul 
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Paul Barrett 

Alpha Group Capital LLC 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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