From: Richard Kahn _}
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: Fwd: LS] CC _OFFSHO 10.000.00 072518
Date: Wed, 25 Jul 2018 17:50:41 +0000
Attachments: LSJE CC OFFSHO 10,000.00 072518.pdf

please advise ok to have pontoons replaced on nanna for total cost of 19,992
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022

tel

cell

Begin forwarded message:

From: LSJ GS! <[ -
Subject: LSJ_CC_OFFSHO_10,000.00_072518
Date: July 25, 2018 at 1:16:07 PM EDT

To: Richard Kahn < >, Daphne Wallace </ [ } - . Cricc
LSJ >

Good Afternoon Rich

Attached completed Credit Card Request Form for Offshore Marine. Could you please confirm when payment

has been completed
Thank you
Warmest regards

The St. James Group
6100 Red Hook Quarter
Suite B3

St Thomas

USVI 00802

EFTA01006387



