
From: Richard Kahn
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: LSJ kitchen fabric 
Date: Wed, 25 Jul 2018 18:40:00 +0000 

Attachments: 141655.pdf; CREDIT_CARD_AUTHORIZATION_FORM.pdf 

should i assume that is showing you all these costs and not bother you with approvals 
please advise on fabric for lsj kitchen banquet and how to move forward with her purchasing.. 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Bella Klein < 
Subject: Fwd: LSJ kitchen fabric 
Date: July 25, 2018 at 2:34:24 PM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn 

Attached is order that placed for fabric LSJ kitchen. No sales tax charged, but BOL needs to be 
forwarded for backup when available. I would suggest to send by fedex economy to Tropical as product is 
about 80 pounds heavy roll. will discuss with Daphne. Please confirm that i can proceed with payment LSJ 
Amex. 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Subject: Re: LSJ kitchen fabric 
Date: July 25, 2018 at 2:14:47 PM EDT 
To: Bella Klein < 
Cc: Daphne Wallace < > 
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Hi Bella, 
Here you are. 

Thank you, 

On Jul 25, 2018, at 2:13 PM, Bella Klein < > wrote: 

Please resend attachment 
Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

On Jul 25, 2018, at 2:06 PM, 

Good afternoon Bella, Daphne and Seth, 

> wrote: 

Seth and I were working on the fabric order for LSJ kitchen banquet. I forwarded below Seth's email with 
the final invoice and the credit card form. 
Please review for accuracy. If all is correct, Bella could you please process the payment? 
Daphne, could you please send our Fedex account to Seth, so that he can have it shipped directly to St. 
Thomas? Also, in case you need, the country of origin is Italy. 

Thank you all very much! 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Seth Pariser 
Date: Jul  2018 at 12:40:09 PM EDT 
To: 
Subject: RE: Jeffrey Epstein order 

Hi 

Yes it is. 
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Quote revised. 

Please include a contact person and tel. phone number for LSJE. 

Also, please advise your FedEx acct. for shipping the order to USVI on. 

Thank you, 

Seth 

Seth Pariser 

Senior Vice President 

Christopher Hyland Incorporated 

D & D Building 

979 Third Avenue, Suite 1710 

New York, NY 10022 

T: / M: / F: /Follow us on 
Instagram Ochristopherhylandinc

EFTA01006390


