
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@grnail.com> 
To: Larry Visoski -Ma> 

Subject: Re: B727 N908JE deal 
Date: Thu, 26 Jul 2018 23:45:50 +0000 

Ok 

On Fri, Jul 27, 2018 at 12:38 AM Larry Visoski c wrote: 
Jeffrey 
I'm working a deal with Frank Rivera, (he was the guy who didn't preform when you sold the B727 engines to 
FJTurbines). 
He said he has a buyer for the 727 at $100k, he asked if he got the price to $125k, if he could keep the $25k as 
commission,. 
(He also said he would give me a portion of that). 
I hope you approve, I told Frank, yes, if he could prove he gets $125k for the plane, he can keep the $25k 
commish, and include me. Also, I told him the new owner will be responsible for parking at Stambaugh $2,500 
per month until the new owner decided what to do with the plane after closing, 
Could be another dreamer, but its worth my efforts, 

Do you approve? 

Thx 
Larry 

Larry. 
I have a firm commitment on the AC at $100K. 
If I can get $125K will the owner consider letting me have $25K Commission? 
Let's discuss. I CAN and will share. 

Frank 

Sent from my iPad 
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