
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Rich Kahn

Subject: Fwd: LSJ MC Kitchen Cabinets Refurbishment 
Date: Mon, 13 Aug 2018 22:26:19 +0000 

 Forwarded message 
From: Jeffrey E. leevacation@gmail.com>
Date: Mon, Aug 13, 2018 at 6:25 PM 
Sub'ect: Re: LSJ MC Kitchen Cabinets Refurbishment 
To: 

No they install. - no way us. Kickboards etc 

On Mon, Aug 13, 2018 at 6:23 PM wrote: 
Good evening 

Attached proposal: 
Refurbishment Kitchen Cabinets, for your review. 

Cost: $14926.00 
Lead time: 3 Weeks 
Install: By Client 
Hardware: Will use existing Pulls, new Hinges 
Price includes delivery to Tropical 

Kyle noted hardware cost was approx double the cost. 

Do you wish too proceed with ordering? 

regards 

The Saint James Group 
USVI 

Ph 
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