From: [N I - -
To: jeffrey E. <jeevacation(wgmail.com=
Subject: Re:
Date: Tue, 07 Aug 2018 08:24:33 +0000

Omg, it’s so generous and kind of you! Thank vou so much Jeffrey, incredibly kind and thoughtful - as always.

Big kiss!

On 7 Aug 2018, at 03:05, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(dgmail.com™> wrote:

Of course and as a wedding present 1ll pay for tickets

On Mon, Aug 6, 2018 at 8:58 PM -_ ﬂ_‘-‘ wrote:

Hi Jeffrey my dear!

Hope you are doing great!

My man’s birthday is upcoming and [ was thinking about buying us a trip to New York for spring 2019. He
hasn’t yet been there and | know he would love to go there with me.

I was wondering, 1f | manage to get a good deal for flight tickets, could 1 still count on you for the
accommaodation, will you still be kind to me even after me being married? :)

I was looking for something in the end of March, beginning April 2019, for about 10days in town.

Sending you my kisses!
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