
From: Richard Kahn • 
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: Quotation from MMX 
Date: Tue, 14 Aug 2018 21:22:10 +0000 

i discussed with both Brice and Mike Glidden last week who apparently never followed up with vendor as 
invoice appears to have over billed labor and travel charges: 2,850, 7,000 and 7,000 
Mike Glidden and Brice clearly never reviewed before it was presented to me for payment as when i questioned 
them they had no explanations.... 

i will resolve now.. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York NY 10022 

On Aug 14, 2018, at 5:17 PM, Jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 
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 Forwarded message   
From: LSJ GSJ  
Date: Tue, Aug 14, 2018 at 5:15 PM 
Subject: Fwd: Quotation from MMX 
To: Richard Kahn
Cc: JE Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Good Afternoon 
Question, reference payment? 
Please advise when this will be completed 
Thank you 
Regards 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Mike Metcalf
Date: August 14, 2018 at 1:20:31 PM AST 
To: michael glidden  
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Cc:' " , brice gordon <bgordon.lsiggmail.com>

Subject: RE: Quotation from MMX 

Michael, 

Just following up on this. We sent the info requested over but still haven't received the signed order acknowledgement 
or the deposit. When you have a moment please give me a call to discuss. 

Best Regards, 

Mike Metcalf 

Metcalf Marine Exhaust, Inc. 

3326 S.W. 3rd Avenue 

Fort Lauderdale, FL 33315 

<image001.jpg>l

<image002.jpg> 

proudly installing quality MMX brand products 

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended 
recipient(s) and may contain confidential and proprietary information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or 
distribution is prohibited. If you receive this in error please contact the sender or reply by e-mail and destroy all copies 
of the original message 
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From: michael glidden [mailto: 
Sent: Tuesday, August 07, 2018 10:46 AM 
To: Mike Metcalf 
Cc: ; brice gordon; 
Subject: Re: Quotation from MMX 

Good morning Mike. 

Yes, the project has been approved. Please forward how payment is to be made and we will get going on that. 

Just to confirm, the measuring will be done on St Thomas with the boat still in the water and in service. Let 
me know your schedule on that. 

The schedule for getting the boat on the hard and you getting to PR for installation will be a phone call, more 
than likely tomorrow. We have a bit of coordination to do on our end yet. I will let you know. 

Thanks, 

MG. 

On Aug 7, 2018, at 10:35 AM, Mike Metcalf < > wrote: 

Hello Michael, 

I was speaking with Bill today and he informed me that the job has been approved. If you have an idea on when we 
will receive the SO% I will get with my production manager and get a completion date as well as schedule my guy to 
come over to measure up for the exhaust. I look forward to hearing back from you. 

Best Regards, 

Mike Metcalf 

Metcalf Marine Exhaust, Inc. 

3326 S.W. 3rd Avenue 

Fort Lauderdale, FL 33315 
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proudly installing quality MMX brand products 

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended 
recipient(s) and may contain confidential and proprietary information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or 
distribution is prohibited. If you receive this in error please contact the sender or reply by e-mail and destroy all copies 
of the original message 

From: michael glidden [mailto: 
Sent: Wednesday, August 01, 2018 9:00 AM 
To: Mike Metcalf 
Cc: brice gordon; 
Subject: Re: Quotation from MMX 

Good morning Mike. 

Thank you. I have forwarded this on to the powers that be. 

Thanks for your patience. 

MG. 

On Aug 1, 2018, at 8:54 AM, Mike Metcalf 'c

Michael & Bill : 

> wrote: 

Just wanted to follow up on this estimate. The muffler manufacture confirmed that they can manufacture the 
mufflers in 1 week from the time I place the order. Please get back to me when you can to discuss. 
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Best Regards, 

Mike Metcalf 

Metcalf Marine Exhaust, Inc. 

3326 S.W. 3rd Avenue 

Fort Lauderdale, FL 33315 

<image001.jpg> 
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proudly installing quality MMX brand products 

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended 
recipient(s) and may contain confidential and proprietary information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or 
distribution is prohibited. If you receive this in error please contact the sender or reply by e-mail and destroy all copies 
of the original message 

<Est_13989_from_Metcalf Marine_Ezhaust_Inc._3728.pdf> 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
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and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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