
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Absolute Flooring Labor 
Date: Thu, 23 Aug 2018 23:17:49 +0000 

> 

Ok 

On Thu, Aug 23, 2018 at 7:17 PM Richard Kahn - 
attached is Absolute Flooring breakdown of labor and prep materials.. 
it appears there is no charges for redoing finishes.. 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HRRK Acenriatac Inn 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Paul Schumacher • 
Subject: LSJ 
Date: Au ust 23, 2018 at 4:48:27 PM EDT 
To: " " < 
Cc: Luis Ramos < 

Good afternoon, 

Attached is the revised wood flooring change order per your request. 
If you have any questions or concerns please let us know. 

Thanks, 

Paul Schumacher I Estimator 

> wrote: 
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please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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