
From: Richard Kahn 
To: Jeffrey Epstein leevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: GSJ 25K RO Plant 
Date: Fri, 24 Aug 2018 00:01:24 +0000 

Attachments: Proposal_25_KGPD_SWRO_System_Great_Stiames_6-30-2018.pdf; 
GSJWaterSupplyOptionsLTR2-19-2016Final.pdf 

i did not send wire today for GSJ RO as my thoughts and concerns are as follows: 

I) dean will be onsite all week (8/27-8/31) and thought just in case after walking GSJ he changes design or 
approach on RO 
2) the last quote for LSJ i was able to negotiate and if i sent wire today i would lose that ability. 

below are highlights of quote which is attached below on PDF 
note i also included below TSG quote from 2016 which also gave a nice summary of what we inherited.. 

Cost: $213,810 for 25,000 gallons per day seawater RO unit 
Leadtime for equipment to ship from Florida: 16 to 18 weeks 
Installation: 1 week of labor 

Note the 213,810 does not include the following additional costs: 

a) shipping and clearing of equipment from FL to STT and transpiration to STT 
b) transportation / hotels and meals for installers 
c) permitting 
d) piping and conduit, trenching and restoration for all buried pipelines and electrical conduits 
e) final design, supply and construction of the container mounting platform 

please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Date: July 3, 2018 at 8:55:59 AM EDT 
To: Rich Kahn

EFTA01007566



Subject: GSJ 25K RO Plant 

Rich 

attached for your review: 

Proposal for a 25KGPD SWRO system for GSJ 
Let me know when you have time to discuss. 

regards 

The Saint James Group 
USVI 

From: Bob Petersen
Date: February 19, 2016 at 11:22:32 AM EST 
To: Richard Kahn 
Cc: Chip Harris , Michael Malo < 
Subject: GSJ Island - Water Supply Options Letter from TSG 

Dear Richard, 

Please see attached letter. 

As we described, this is budgetary pricing only and can be adjusted as more details are filled in. Thank you for the 
opportunity. 

Best Regards, 

Bob Petersen 
General Manager 
TSG Water Resources  USVI 
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