
From: Richard Kahn
To: ann rodriquez < 
Cc: , Daphne Wallace < 

Subject: Re: Bryan's Plant: Fwd: Invoices 
Date: Wed, 22 Aug 2018 21:13:05 +0000 

any update on seagrape arrival 
please advise 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Aug 9, 2018, at 3:30 PM, Ann Rodriquez < 

Seagrape arrival to St. Thomas Aug 21st-22nd 

Contact info to coordinate Seagrape pickup: 
Jackie "Bryan's Plant" 
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Ann R. 

On Aug 8, 2018, at 12:51 PM, Richard Kahn < 

> wrote: 

wrote: 

Anna any update on timing of when we will receive. Please advise. Thank you. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Aug 6, 2018, at 11:01 AM, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 
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Thank you 
Please advise on timing when we expect to receive 

On Aug 4, 2018, at 11:47 AM, Ann Rodriquez ‹ > wrote: 

Hi all, 

2 invoices attached from Bryan's Plant 50 (5-5 1/2ft.) and 50 (4-
4 1/2ft.). 

1st deposit of $8,250.00 processed but not released until 
revised invoice is sent. 
-Please see revised invoice attached for 50 (5-5 1/2ft.) 
Seag rapes 

2nd and final payment of $8,250.00 to be processed and 
released once Seagrapes has arrived to LSJ. 
-Please see revised invoice attached 50 (4-4 1/2ft.) Seagrapes 

Ann R. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Jackie Neuburger < > 
Date: August 4, 2018 at 9:53:35 AM AST 
To:" < 

Subject: Invoices 

Hi Ann 
I have attached the invoices for the 100 seagrape. 
Thanks 

Jackie Neuburger 
Bryan's Plants and Landscaping 
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MIS 
We bring paradise to your home! 

<Bryans Plants Invoice for Little st. James 7-24-2018.doc> 

<Bryans Plants Invoice for Little St James 8-4-2018.doc> 
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