
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.eom> 
To: 

Subject: Re: John Brockman 
Date: Tue, 21 Aug 2018 16:57:22 +0000 

Tell him two different charities 

On Tue, Aug 21, 2018 at 12:32 PM > wrote: 
John Brockman received a check for $25,000. He says Jeffrey had promised $60,000. John says he will hold 
on to the $25,000 and not deposit. He is hoping it was just an error. 

Sent from my iPhone 
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