
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Concrete Supply to LSJE 
Date: Fri, 17 Aug 2018 19:56:40 +0000 

ask her if she can also do 3 miles of road. 

On Fri, Aug 17, 2018 at 3:11 PM, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 
Attached is proposal which Kyle, Daphne and I just reviewed with Marian for GSJ Heli Pad pour. 
Price for 100 yard pour (100 foot diameter = 97 yards) was $21,349 which did not include laborers and 
framing materials, mesh wire, rebar, etc. Marian will provide those numbers later this afternoon. 

Kyle informs me that Jules will need 1 week to prep grading of the site which with your permission we would 
have done next week. Tentative days to pour concrete would be Thursday August 30th and Friday August 
31st leaving 2-3 days to lay forms and electrical conduit before the pour. 

Please advise if diameter of helipad is 90 feet or 100 feet and timing for everything is ok. 
(90 foot diameter would be 79-80 yards) 

Thank you 

Also in quote below is info on Redi Rock if you have any interest.. 

Richard Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax  
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Marian Prescod" 
Subject: Concrete Supply to LSJE 
Date: August 16. 2018 at 4:13:23 PM EDT 
To: < 
Cc: < 

Rich and Daphne: 
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Thank you for the time taken to discuss ORTALIS Concrete and how we may be able to support your projects on the 
islands. I have given you a broad view of the company in this attachment, and an endearing deal to win your business 
for this pour contemplated on the upcoming week. I trust that you will see how valuable a relationship this can be for 
both us as we seek growth opportunities that showcase our talents and products and for you as you require quality 
concrete and development support services. 

Please let me know if you wish to discuss further or to order concrete. 

Most Sincerely, 

Marian P. Prescod, PMP, CGMS 

ORTALIS CONCRETE 
3004 Estate Altona 
Suite 12 
St. Thomas, USVI 00802 

el 
ax 
I Cell 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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