
From: Ann Rodriquez < 

To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacationggmail.eom> 

Subject: Piney Woods: Mr. Barber 

Date: Thu, 10 Jan 2019 18:58:17 +0000 

Sent from my iPhone 
Begin forwarded message: 

From: William Barber
Date: January 10, 2019 at 1:55:42 PM AST 
To: ann rodriquez 
Cc: William Barber Tanisha Gaylord
Subject: Re: Attached Image 

01/10/2019: 

Hello Ms. Rodriquez: 

Praying all is well with you. 

I met with the Finance Office the other day and I know that the income information that you supplied to our 
office, was passed on to them for further processing. Based on your information / request in this email, I am 
supplying you with the email address for Ms. Tanisha Gaylord, who works in the Finance Office. She would 
have more up to date information on how quickly that Tuition & Enrollment Agreement can be sent directly to 
you. Her email address is: and I have included her on this email response as well. 
(Email is the quickest and most assured way of reaching her.) 

Please travel well and be careful in your daily routines looking forward to having your daughter join The 
Piney Woods Family. 

Sincerely, 
William M. Barber 
Senior Admissions Officer 
The Piney Woods School 
Piney Woods, Mississippi 39148 

From: Ann Rodriquez < 
Sent: Thursday, January 10, 2019 10:31 AM 
To: William Barber 
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Cc: Jeffrey Epstein 
Subject: Re: Attached Image 

Good Morning Mr. Barber, 

Just a reminder... 
I still haven't received any of the Tuition information as yet? 

I depart from St. Thomas on Sunday 13th and I would really like to be prepared for her enrollment on Monday 
the 14th? 

I depart Mississippi Tuesday morning at 6am 
My email address: 
My Fax number is: 340-775-2528 

Thank you for all your help, 
Ann Rodriquez 

Sent from my iPhone 

(it's "Q"uez not "G"uez) 

On Jan 7, 2019, at 4:53 PM, William Barber < > wrote: 

01/07/2019: 

Hello Ms. Rodriquez: 

The best way to pay the $50.00 app fee is to contact Ms. Libby Snell, Senior Accountant here at The Piney 
Woods School, at and her email address is: Isnell@pineywoods.org.

I'm giving you her email address so in case there is an issue with playing phone tag, you can email her and let 
her know exactly what time you can call her. 

Thanks again. 

Sincerely, 
William M. Barber 
Senior Admissions Officer 
The Piney Woods School 

From: ann rodriquez 
Sent: Monday, January 7, 2019 3:42 PM 
To: William Barber 
Subject: Fw: Attached Image 

<S> 
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DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this e-mail may be privileged,confidential, and protected 
from disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, 
distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies. 

---- Forwarded Messa 
From: ann rodri uez < 
To: 
Sent: Monday, January 7, 2019 02:15:57 PM -04 
Subject: Re: Attached Image 

Good afternoon Mr. Barber, 

Please see attachment for the requested information to complete Sierra Poleon's enrollment. 
-Medical Consent Form 
-Leave Authorization Form 
-Student Health History 
-$50.00 Application Fee 

Would you like me to call in a Credit Card to pay for the application fee? 

Thank you, 
Ann R. 

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this e-mail may be privileged,confidential, and protected 
from disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, 
distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies. 

On Monday, January 7, 2019 10:31:04 AM -04, wrote: 
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