From: ] <jeevacation(@gmail.com>
To: Richard Kahn Hx—-“-*
Subject: Re: L8] Dive Platform
Date: Fri, 04 Jan 2019 20:41:59 +0000

More silly. With so much wrong replac ok

On Fri, Jan 4, 2019 at 3:38 PM Richard Kahn ﬂi_'-'-* wrote:

please confirm you requested new diving board for flagpole pool
total cost landed on LSJ 12,967

thank you

Richard Kahn

HBEK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:

From: Daphne Wallace <[} -
Subject: Fwd: LSJ Dive Platform
Date: January 4, 2019 at 4:12:55 PM EST

To: Rich Kahn < > brice gordon < ,LSJ GSJ
= Kyle reavis < >

Greetings Rich,
Request: Replace the existing dive board and platform at the Flagpole Pool.

Information: The existing unit was purchased and installed in 2011, The original purchase via VI Gunite
Pools 1s attached for reference. The new dive platform is a Duraflex diving board, the same length of 14 feet
as the current board, and the Duraflex short stand with handrails. The specs and quote 15 attached below.

Cost: (1) Duraflex Diving board, 14 ft - Model DUR-66-231-324 = $4.055.00
(1) Duraflex Short Stand with handrails - Model 70-231-520 = $7.342.00
Taxes: $0.00
Estimated Shipping to FL: $590.00
EDA to FL: 2-5 weeks (2-4 weeks lead time / 5 business days from Georgia to FL)
Estimated Shipping to STT: $750.00
Estimated Customs duties: $0.00
Clearance: $80.00
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Trucking: $ 150.00
Estimated Total: $12,967.00

————————— - Forwarded message ----—---—--

From: | -

Date: Fri, Jan 4, 2019 at 2:40 PM
Subject: LSJ Dive Platform

To: Daphne Wallace < >
Cc: LSI GSJ = =

Hello daphne

Attached 1s Proposal and spec for a new Dive Platform for the Flag Pole Pool.
Also the original purchase invoice for the existing Platform and Stand.
We have refurbished the existing to but due to location and underlying condition it is best we replace it

The existing unit was purchased in 2011
requesting approval to purchase
any concerns let me know

regards

The Saint James Group
USVI

please note
The information contained in this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 15 the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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