From: ] <jeevacation(@gmail.com>

To: Richard Kahn <||

Subject: Re: Zorro Ranch Road Project
Date: Thu, 03 Jan 2019 22:14:26 +0000

how 1s it that vou expect to be paid in full for work that 1s very very incomplete.

On Thu, Jan 3, 2019 at 5:11 PM Richard Kahn _‘-* wrote:

please advise on reply
thank you

Eichard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel
fax [ NG
cel! | NG

Begin forwarded message:

From: Gilbert Luna <}

Subject: Zorro Ranch Road Project

Date: January 3, 2019 at 3:39:10 PM EST

Cc: Richard Kahn < >

Hello R

I am following up to confirm our last phone conversation in which I assured you that we are going to
resurface the upper road when the weather allows. It will probably be March before it warms up enough. In
the mean time, please address our past due accounts. We are owed % 137,869 88 for the work we did in
October,and § 45,758.84 for November's billing. The final 5% of the contract has not yet been billed for.
Please pay.

Thank you,

Grilbert A, Luna
President

EFTA01009508



3825 Academy Parkway North, [JJ|}
Albuguergue, NM 87109

Cell Phone

Phone:

Fax:

please note
The information contained in this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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