
From: J <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: LSJ GSJ

Subject: Re: Nautitect 
Date: Thu, 03 Jan 2019 11:21:18 +0000 

please send vanity design 

On Thu, Jan 3, 2019 at 5:53 AM LSJ GSJ < 
Good Morning 
Will forward details once confirmed later today 

On Jan 2, 2019, at 8:09 PM, J <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

timing? 

On Wed, Jan 2, 2019 at 6:37 PM LSJ GSJ < 

Good Evening 
Please note estimate for repair work on Nautica 
$13,500.00 
Please advise how you wish to proceed 
Wannest regards 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Randy Amparo 
Date: January 2, 2019 at 7:06:37 PM AST 
To:  II< 

>, Karen
Subject: Fwd: Nautitect 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Eldred Williams
Date: January 2, 2019 at 4:23:09 PM AST 
To: Carlos Rodriguez < >, Randy Amparo 
Subject: Nautitect 

Happy New Year! 

wrote: 

> wrote: 

Hope you had a Wonderfull Holiday. 
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Concerning the Rotten areas on the Nautitect. 
To remove and manufacture new floor, and to remove all rotten wood and replace with new on both 
Starboard and Port entrance we are estimating about $13,500.00. 

Please note this is only an estimate. 

Thank you and Regards 
Narinee Seonarain 
B.V.I. Painters Ltd Marine Refinishers 
Nanny Cay Marina 
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