
From: J <jeevacation@grnail.com> 

To: 
Subject: Re: ESTIMATE & DETAILS DEKTON COUNTERTOPS 

Date: Mon, 31 Dec 2018 19:56:13 +0000 

floe 

On Mon, Dec 31, 2018 at 2:37 PM > wrote: 
Attached 
Photos of selected material Dekton Halo against Cabinet Material 
Photo of selected samples of wall, floor and Dekton Halo countertop material. 
E mail from Karyna in reference to countertops material, confirming selection of Material. 

Link regarding chosen material for your reference 

Granite was discussed but decided, it would not be the clean look you wished to have. 
I still have Dekton Halo Sample on site, if you wish to reconfirm selection. 
I will request pricing option for both 1.5" and 2" 

Do you still wish to proceed with pricing for White Quartz Material instead of the Dekton Halo.? 

regards 

On Mon, Dec 31, 2018 at 2:15 PM J leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 
lye not seen the material, get prices for alternatives 

On Mon, Dec 31, 2018 at 1:13 PM 
Good Afternoon 

wrote: 

Attached Estimate for Cabana's 1-4 and Pool Cabana Countertops by Kitchen Solvers of Miami, 
Material: Dekton Halo 
Total Cost of Material, fabrication and Crates 
$31,400.00 
Deposit of 65% required to move forward 

Not included in total is travel and accommodation 
Once estimate is approved, we will then schedule site visit to confirm measurements. 
Can we proceed? 

regards I= 

 Forwarded message 
From: Ghislaine Demombynes
Date: Mon, Dec 31, 2018 at 1:36 PM 
Sub'ect: ESTIMATE & DETAILS DEKTON COUNTERTOPS 
To: 
Cc: 

EFTA01009851



Hello =, 

Attached is the estimate for the work. Because of the nature of the work I cannot modify the payment 
terms. 

I can send Adrian to confirm measurements as soon as you approve the estimate. (passport scan will be 
sent for ticket). 

We need 1 week to receive the DEKTON and 1 week to fabricate. 

So we should be able to deliver to TROPICAL less than 3 weeks after first payment. 

Wish you both a Happy New Year!! 

Ghislaine Demombynes 

Kitchen Solvers Miami 

The Saint James Group 
USVI 

Ph: 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
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including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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