
From: Richard Kahn

To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: request our donations be given to melanoma foundation and ask brad wechsler to 
transfer his to MIT 

Date: Fri, 28 Dec 2018 19:39:25 +0000 

Attachments: ASU FOUNDATION DONATIONS.xlsx 

Inline-Images: image002.png 

Attached are gratitude and enhanced donations. Please advise which in particular you are referring to. Thank 
you. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York NY 10022 
Photan 
Fax 
Cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Jeanne Brennnan Wiebracht"
Date: December 28, 2018 at 11:34:03 AM PST 
To: "'Richard Kahn" 
Cc: "'Darren Indyke"'
Subject: RE: request our donations be given to melanoma foundation and ask brad o echsler to transfer 
his to MIT 

Rich, 
See attached. Note JEVIF donated to ASU foundation but Gratitude did not. 

FYI - However Gratitude did make a donation to the University of Arizona Foundations in 2017 — not sure if it's the same 
institution — they have different mailing addresses 

Jeanne 

From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Friday, December 28, 2018 3:04 PM 
To: Jeanne Brennan < > 
Cc: Darren Indyke 
Subject: Fwd: request our donations be given to melanoma foundation and ask brad wechsler to transfer his to MIT 

Jeanne can you please provide details of our asu foundation donations from gratitude and enhanced over the past three 
years. Thank you. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

EFTA01010168



Begin forwarded message: 

From:1 <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Date: December 28, 2018 at 8:23:18 AM PST 
To: Richard Kahn c >, Darren Indyke 
Subject: request our donations be given to melanoma foundation and ask brad wechsler to transfer his to MIT 

Funds Donated to MU Foundation for Origins Project: If, within 90 days 
of the Effective Dote, any of the following donors to the ASU Foundation to support the 
Origins Project makes a request that the ASU Foundation return their donation, ASU will 
not oppose the return of funds to the donor: 

(a) Donors who contributed 54,000 or more, including multiple donations from a 
single family, since January 1, 2017; and 
(b) Donors who contributed in excess of $300,000 since 2010. 

Only requests from these individuals or groups will be considered for return. The ASU 
Foundation shall be solely responsible for determining the method for calculating the 
amount of funds attributable to each donor that are available for return, making the 
calculation, and specifying the form of the consent or direction necessary from the donor. 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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