
From: Kyle reavis  
To: brice gordon  
Cc: J leevacation@gmail.com>, Richard Kahn < 

Subject: Re: Countertops 
Date: Thu, 20 Dec 2018 19:39:18 +0000 

Attachments: Counter Top_SDs.pdf 

>, LSJ GSJ 

Please see attached for SD for CT - added in a few for FFP 

On Thu, Dec 20, 2018 at 12:21 PM brice gordon < > wrote: 
Good morning 

Quick update 
My flight out of ABQ had mechanical issues, so will be traveling back to STT tonight 
Contacted Lowes and Home Depot, there procedure is 
purchase product from them, then they put you in contact with a independent contractor to fabricate and install 
They where very hesitant regarding Fabricating from shop drawings, and also had concerns regarding shipping. 

I have reached out to Miami Kitchen Solvers, Ghislaine will be calling me back later today 
Kyle is doing Shop Drawings of all locations 
I hoping Ghislaine will be able to put us in contact with independent fabricator in Miami. 

Regards Brice 

On Wed, Dec 19, 2018 at 6:18 PM J <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 
if you hay time go to lowes. or call the kitchen lady. showers installed incorrectly wild.. how was the 
ranch 

 Forwarded message   
From: brice gordon  
Date: Wed, Dec 19, 2018 at 5:11 PM 
Subject: Re: Countertops 
To: J leevacation@gmail.com>

I'm coming back from the ranch 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 19, 2018, at 3:08 PM, J <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

no i appreciate the offer.. go to ranch , have a safe flight. thx. anyway, . 

On Wed, Dec 19, 2018 at 5:07 PM brice gordon < > wrote: 
Good evening Jeffrey 
I'm transiting thru MIA tomorrow morning 
Propose I rent a car and try and resolve this situation, either Home Depot or a independent fabricator 
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It's a long shot especially so close to Christmas 
Kyle can you get me exact measurements by 10 am tomorrow ? 
Should I proceed ?? 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 19, 2018, at 12:29 PM, J <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

does home depot do the same custom tops that i sent you , ask brice to ask the kitchen people form 
florida this is s00000 wrong 

On Wed, Dec 19, 2018 at 2:23 PM Kyle reavis < wrote: 
Good Afternoon, 

Ken is not in the shop currently. I am very worried about the workmanship and the chipping on the 
edges. It looks like he has all of the back countertops cut but he has not made any of the 45° cuts 
made for the fronts. No work has been done on the vanity sinks or flag pole kitchen. I would 
suggest we get ready for going to EB for a credit or money back. 

Kyle 
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The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
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return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
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including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
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Brice Gordon 
The Saint James Group 
USVI 
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