From: | <jeevacation(@gmail.com>
To: David Mitchell <[}
Subject: Re:
Date: Wed, 12 Dec 2018 12:20:00 +0000

you had said the mortagae would be done by year end |, 1s that still on track/? ?

On Wed, Dec 12, 2018 at 8:04 AM David Mitchell <

Correct ,it 15 to be today or tomorrow based on hotel bank release of lock box

Mitchell Holdings LLC
745 Fifth Avenue

New York NY 10151
USA

On Dec 12, 2018, at 6:53 AM, ] <jeevacationfa gmail.com> wrote:

rich tells me the money was not paid back on monday?
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