
From: Larry Visoski 
To: J <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: Update - 1085 
Date: Tue, 11 Dec 2018 23:33:08 +0000 

Gary is working a Buyer In LA„ 
(They are figuring out costs for Avionic improvements required for 2020.,) 

Ed Saltzman is still $2.5M area, maybe a little more. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 11, 2018, at 7:20 PM. J <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

any other buyers?? 

On Tue, Dec 11, 2018 at 7:16 PM Larry Visoski c wrote: 
See email from Wendy below, 
Best case is Jan 15th for a closing, 
(I don't like the fact she mentioned he would buy a GIVSP) 
I don't feel good about the Buyer performing at this point. 

scheduled for GIV re-current Dec 17th - 20th., 

Do you approve me attending GIV training Dec 17th? 

Thx 
Larry 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From:
Date: December 11, 2018 at 3:57:59 PM AST 
To: "'Larry Visoski"' 
Cc: "'Chuck Bierwirthm 
Subject: Update - 1085 

Dear Larry, 

I finally just spoke with Lars after almost a week. In order to clear up their problem they are required to 
obtain a foreign court order which has been slow in coming. It has been very slow going and legal 
translations are required for all documents which further slows the process. He hopes they will get the 
court order before Christmas, but if not the holidays will further delay things. Anyway to make a short 
story long without giving you the details I would like to but cannot, he said he hopes the aircraft is there in 
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January and that he would be ready to close by the 15th- He reiterated that he is definitely buying a G-IVSP 
and would like it to be 1085 because they know it is a good aircraft, and they are so far along in the process, 
and have tentatively found crew. He also understands if you do not want to wait and decide to sell it 
elsewhere. 

I wish things were moving quicker and I could tell you more. I am guessing that once the court order is 
issued, I may be allowed to provide further details. 

All the best, 

Wendy 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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