
From: "Martin G. Weinberg"

To: "'Richard Kr, "er <jeevacation@gmail.com>, "'Martin 
Weinberg"' 

Subject: RE: CONFIDENTIAL 

Date: Tue, 04 Dec 2018 13:18:37 +0000 

Attachments: Invoice_December 3_2018.doc 

Richard, the invoice for legal services in November is attached. Thanks, Marty 

From: Richard Kahn [mailto 
Sent: Friday, November 9, 2018 11:46 AM 
To: Martin G. Weinberg < > 
Subject: Re: CONFIDENTIAL 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 212-971-1306 
fax 212-320-0381 
cell 917-414-7584 

On Nov I, 2018, at 9:51 AM, Martin G. Weinberg <=1.1e wrote: 

Richard, the invoice for legal services in October is attached. Thanks. Marty 
Martin G Weinberg PC 
20 Park Plaza 
Suite 1000 
Boston, MA 02116 
Tel 617 227 3700 
Cell 617 901 3472 
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