
From: J <jeevacation®gmail.com> 
To: Kyle reavis 

Subject: Re: Price for EIFS 
Date: Tue, 04 Dec 2018 10:45:05 +0000 

where are we with the wall guy. danny? if we pay his price will he begin? 

On Tue, Dec 4, 2018 at 4:56 AM Kyle reavis < > wrote: 
This is Jay's pricing for repairs on all the eifs, please let me know if you want to proceed with this. 

Kyle 
 Forwarded messa e 
From: "Jay Knoepfel" 
Date: Dec 3, 2018 8:25 PM 
Subject: Re: Price for EIFS 
To: "Kyle reavis" 
Cc: 

The pricing for the EIFS 
1. Cabana 1- 4 $8,400 
2. Kitchen building $12,125 
3. Library $16,400 included in roof works 
4. Master Bedroom $8,500 included on roof works 

This work on Cabana 1-4 and the kitchen building can be completed by December 14 if it started by this 
Thursday. Jpk will require payment this week on past invoices, to pay for this and other work in progress if 
it is to supply labor and materials to achieve these goals. 

Sent from my iPhone 

> On Dec 3, 2018, at 3:12 PM, Kyle reavis < > wrote: 

> Jay, 

> mr epstein would like you to send over pricing for fixing the following EIFS. 

> Cabana 1-4 
> Kitchen Building 
> Library 
> Master Bedroom 

> Kyle 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
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constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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