
From: Richard Kahn
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Cc: Daphne Wallace

Subject: Brian Bates 
Date: Thu, 29 Nov 2018 20:27:39 +0000 

Daphne and i just reviewed Brian Bate's file and see no mention of 3pm departure each day.. 
Also none of the time sheets make note of 3pm departure.. 

We are running a separate boat at 3pm each day for Brian? 
not the most efficient use of our labor and equipment... 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: LSJ GSJ  
Subject: Re: 8502E8A5-ECA9.4C59-9D02-E4E04D0FD04C 
Date: November 29, 2018 at 3:15:48 PM EST 
To: J Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Cc: Richard Kahn < 

Good Afternoon 
The attached E Mail was forwarded from STC Offices, which was more about reflecting the payroll as you 
requested. 
Brian is to leave at 3:00pm,working thru his lunch hour as he requested, when he started GSJ Tiki Project. He 
left at 2:30pm on Tues, this was note and is reflected on Log In/Out Sheet 
regards 
Karen 

On Thu, Nov 29, 2018 at 7:08 AM J <jeevacation®gmail.com> wrote: 
this says 13 landscapers? given the sad state of affairs. we need to change. i see brian is at 300 perday. 
but he leays at 230?? 

On Thu, Nov 29, 2018 at 6:00 AM LSJ GSJ < wrote: 
Good Morning 
Attached details, that was provided from STC noting the pay increase you gave Nicholas is not reflected on 
this sheet 
He is receiving $19.00 an hr 
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Regards 
Karen 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation®gmail.com. and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

The St. James Grou 
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