
From: J <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

To: LSJ GSJ <thesaintjames.group@gmail.com>, Richard Kahn 

Subject: Re: 8502E8A5-ECA9-4C59-9D02-E4E04D0FD04C 
Date: Thu, 29 Nov 2018 11:07:59 +0000 

this says 13 landscapers? given the sad state of affairs. we need to change. i see brian is at 300 perday. but 
he leays at 230?? 

On Thu, Nov 29, 2018 at 6:00 AM LSJ GSJ <thesaintjames.group_®gmail.com> wrote: 
Good Morning 
Attached details, that was provided from STC noting the pay increase you gave Nicholas is not reflected on 
this sheet 
He is receiving $19.00 an hr 
Regards 
Karen 
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