
From: Richard Kahn 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jecvacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: Karl - Payroll - November 27, 2018 
Date: Wed, 28 Nov 2018 20:45:37 +0000 

Attachments: ICarl_Henry_-_Payroll_-_November 27,_2018.pdf; k,hemy.pdf 

Karl would have received 2,260 over the past 4 weeks 
Karl is cleared to go back to work but cannot lift over 5 pounds... 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 212-971-1306 
fax 717-370-0381 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Daphne Wallace 
Subject: Karl - Payroll - November 27, 2018 
Date: November 28, 2018 at 4:36:09 PM EST 
To: Rich Kahn < >, Jeanne Brennan < 

Greetings Rich, 

Attached are copies of Karl's pay periods 10/29-11/11/18 and 11/12-11/25/18 - $2,260.16 

This is the amount he would have received if he was working or had sick leave to cover the time. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Daphne Wallace 
Subject: Fwd: receipts 
Date: November 28, 2018 at 3:55:08 PM EST 
To: LSJ GSJ < >, Rich Kahn a=lin Jeanne 
Brennan 
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Greetings Karen, 

Attached please find the COG invoice for Karl's follow up doctor's visit - $171.02 placed on BG VISA 6512. 

I spoke with Karl, he has a note from the doctor stating he can report back to work, but is to not lift anything 
heavier than 5 pounds, and no repetitive bending or stooping, for the next 30 days. 

Karl will bring you the note when he reports in the morning. 

 Forwarded message 
From: LSJ Accounts Payable 
Date: Wed, Nov 28, 2018 at 2:46 PM 
Subject: Re: receipts 
To:   Daphne Wallace 

Greetings Ashana, 

Received with thanks and kind regards, Daphne 

On Wed, Nov 28, 2018 at 2:15 PM Ashana Kuntz <1 > wrote: 
Good day, 
Please see attachment 

No employee or agent is authorized to conclude any binding agreement on behalf of Comprehensive 
Orthopaedic Global with another party by email without confirmation by an Officer. 
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