
From: Brad Edwards <1 
To: J <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Tue, 27 Nov 2018 16:54:57 +0000 

I cannot agree. For obvious reasons. I don't agree that it impacts what you do with FW but I cannot let that drive 
what we have already agreed to. 

On a break. Can't talk today. Won't be done until late. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Nov 27, 2018, at 10:51 AM, J <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

as i know you woudl like the apology the way you wrote it. I d like some time to go after fowler. . if you 
would prefer not to modify it . how about making the apology in jan same time as the payment. so it gives 
me 5 weeks to see where we are. ? just an idea thxx 
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