
From: Brad Edwards <1 
To: J leevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Tue, 20 Nov 2018 15:01:00 +0000 

Sure 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Nov 20, 2018, at 9:59 AM, J <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

understood. . re can we speak on the phone re M? 

On Tue, Nov 20, 2018 at 9:55 AM Brad Edwards > wrote: 
Our settlement cannot involve And to be clear, I do not know what David will start with or where 
it will end up. There have been no discussions, to my knowledge, witM- who is the client and the only 
one that can make a decision. I am not going to be involved in the settlement negotiations of that case at all. 
So with that out, we are back to my proposal. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Nov 20, 2018, at 9:51 AM, J <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

as you said david was starting at 500k . i suggest the following. 
7 millin includes ( way above my top line :) ) you and i are free to go at fowler.. I will file a 

dec action , to deor e w et er a firm can be released from an unknown claim. you and I can discuss the 
fowler stragey so as to meet the spirit as well as the letter. and im ok with a 50 5o split, 

On The, Nov 20, 2018 at 9:30 AM Brad Edwards <1 > wrote: 
CONFIDENTIAL - FOR SETTLEMENT PURPOSES ONLY 

I've thought this through a little better. 
$7m bottom line (way below my bottom already) 

We are done with personal litigation between us such that no substantive malpractice case could be 
brought against FW. 

Public Apology 

Confidentiality as to the amount of any settlement (and depending on any other terms we can jointly 
decide what more, if anything, should be confidential). 

If we resolve on those terms then I will reach out and resolve contempt proceeding so to ensure you are 
not brought in (although virtually no chance as is). You will in good faith attempt to resolve the 
malpractice claim without a suit and whatever you recover is 50/50 (as you say, that is fair, especially 
since you offered already for first million to go to me, or 500k depending on the scenario). 
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I know you are not one to nickel and dime - is the above acceptable? 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Nov 20, 2018, at 8:50 AM, J leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

tried to call , ping me when free 

018 at 8:20 AM Brad Edwards c wrote: 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Nov 20, 2018, at 8:13 AM, J <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

number? 

On The, Nov 20, 2018 at 8:11 AM Brad Edwards c wrote: 
Ok 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Nov 20, 2018, at 7:32 AM, J leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

I think we should speak . before the call. does 9 am work for you? 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
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