
From: J <jeevacation®gmail.com> 
To: David Mitchell

Subject: Re: 
Date: Thu, 08 Nov 2018 18:42:37 +0000 

where is the hotel sale. , the sculiptures and 82? 

On Thu, Nov 8, 2018 at 7:32 PM David Mitchell wrote: 
The intent is not to mislead at all 

I am doing my best to get this funded 

The buyer of the rooms pushed the payment out two weeks , confirmed this to us and I forwarded you the 
email 

DAVID MITCHELL 

Mitchell Holdin s LLC 

On Nov 8, 2018, at 1:28 PM, J <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

you email to steve is looking inentionally misleading. first oct 16 you say planned to have 375 by nov 
7 and then you say confirmation with a funding date of nov 26, those emails are not clear and present 
a very bad picture 
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