
From: J <jeevacation®gmail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Chris invoice 
Date: Tue, 06 Nov 2018 20:55:59 +0000 

Attachments: IMG 0772.jpeg 
Inline-Images: IMG_0772(1)jpeg 

ok 

On Tue, Nov 6, 2018 at 8:43 PM Richard Kahn < > wrote: 
please advise if ok to proceed with chris at 2700 cost before flights, hotel and food 
note his dog walking was 75 last time vs 100 this time (both of which are insane numbers..) 

also are you ok to prepay chris 100% or do 50% then 50% when completed... 

thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Daphne Wallace > 
Subject: Fwd: Chris invoice 
Date: November 6, 2018 at 3:31:41 PM EST 
To: Rich Kahn ann rodriquez < 

Greetings Rich, 

Attached please find Chris' proposal quote for 6 days (11/14-11/19) on site on LSJ to consult on the Zahidi 
Palms Project. 

We will arrange the flights and confirm the accommodations once JE approves to proceed. 

Thank you and warmest regards. 

 Forwarded message 
From: Ann Rodriquez cl 
Date: Tue, Nov 6, 2018 at 2:17 PM 
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Subject: Chris invoice 
To: Daphne Wallace

Sent from my iPhone 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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