
From: J <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Larry Visoski .:§Ma> 

Subject: Re: Veneer 
Date: Thu, 01 Nov 2018 02:51:18 +0000 

Ok 

On Wed, Oct 31, 2018 at 9:27 PM Larry Visoski c wrote: 
Jeffrey 
Wendy asked if I could fwd the Veneer quote again and his contact info, 
„ she wants to schedule the veneer repair after closing,.s there is no delay in delivering the plane to her buyer 
by Jan 1st, she is scheduling Westfield to accomplish the Remaining due items to clean up the plane until Jan 
1st., after paint ship she is planning Dec 1st back with WestField. 

Do you approve of me sending the below email? 

Wendy, 
Here is the quote for veneer repair for the GIV., 

Larry, 

1-Customer will remove radio rack face panel, credenza top and door panel, L & R galley draw faces and some 
lavatory door panel 
repair as needed sand and re-spray to match existing finish 
match Galley Conan counter top and fabricate close out panel for inboard of galley using all existing hardware 
and some placard may need to replace $45,000 

Seeram James 
Executive Aircraft Interiors,LLC 
208 Christan st 
Oxford,CT 06478 
O - 
F - 
C - 

Sent from my iPhone 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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