
From: J <jeevacationggmail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn 

Subject: Fwd: Steptoe & Johnson LLP 020599 - JEFFREY EPSTEIN 
Date: Sat, 27 Oct 2018 11:18:29 +0000 

Attachments: 020599.00001 JEFFREY EPSTEIN 2576689.pdf; 
020599.00001 JEFFREY EPSTEIN 2545642.pdf 

pay 

 Forwarded message 
From: Colbert-Brown, Mike
Date: Fri, Oct 26, 2018 at 6:31 PM 
Subject: Steptoe & Johnson LLP 020599 - JEFFREY EPSTEIN 
To: jeevaeation(i4gmail.com <jeevacationgiginail.com>

Hello Mr. Epstein, 

My name is Mike and I am contacting you on behalf of Steptoe & Johnson. According to our records, 
payment has not been received for the attached invoices. 

I wanted to quickly follow up with you to ensure that they have been received. The firm would like to 
resolve the outstanding balance by November 5, 2018. 

Please take a few moments to review the invoices and let me know if you have any questions. 

Matter ID Mtr Description 1 Invoice Inv Date Amount Due 
Clt Name 1: JEFFREY EPSTEIN 

020599.00001 CONFIDENTIAL - TM ADVICE 2545642 6/22/2015 $5,380.00 

020599.00001 CONFIDENTIAL - TM ADVICE 2576689 7/19/2016 $1,425.00 

Total (USD) 

Regards, 

S6,8O5.0O

Mike Colbert-Brown 

EFTA01018406



Accounts Receivable Analyst 

Steptoe & Johnson LLP 

Steptoe 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

EFTA01018407


