
From: J <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Bubbler Barge 

Date: Fri, 26 Oct 2018 17:42:58 +0000 

>, Kyle reavis < 

tell kype regrarding a bit cement pour. waterefall or pebble beahc . 5 trucks ? 

On Fri, Oct 26, 2018 at 1:42 PM Richard Kahn < > wrote: 
anna reached out to bubbler to remind him that we still have a 20,000 deposit with him 
he told anna he is available to us now thru Nov 14th then again after Nov 20th.. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: ann rodriquez 
Subject: Re: Bubbler 
Date: October 23, 2018 at 5:37:07 PM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn < 
Cc: Daphne Wallace < 
Reply-To: ann rodriquez 

He's available right now until the 14th and then he will be available again after the 20th. He asked if we had any plans for 
Santa Domingo or PR so he can put it on his schedule 

Mn R. 

DISCLAIMER: The information contained In this e-mail may be privileged,confldential, and protected 
from disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, 
distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this 
communication In error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies. 

On Tuesday, October 23, 2018 3:55 PM, Richard Kahn .4 2. wrote: 

thanks for reaching out 
is he available before or after santa domingo? 
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Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Oct 23, 2018, at 3:44 PM, ann rodriquez < 

Yes, I just spoke to him. 
Bubbler is scheduled to go to Santa Domingo on Nov 15th. 
He said that he's available for us just et him know how he can help 

Ann R. 

> wrote: 

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this e-mail may be privileged,confidential, and protected 
from disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, 
distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies. 

On Tuesday, October 23, 2018 03:05:22 PM -04, Richard Kahn > wrote: 

have you been in touch with him at all 
if not it may be a good idea to remind him that he has 20,000 of our money 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

please note 
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The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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