
From: Richard Kahn 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: PRD 
Date: Fri, 26 Oct 2018 16:28:33 +0000 

Attachments: LSJE_CHK_BVIPAI_11182.55_102618.pdf 

FYI 

brice continues to spend money on PRD 
i know we have no choice but wanted you to be aware...as i believe costs are now approaching 30k over last few 
months.. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 212-971-1306 
fax 212-320-0381 
cell 917-414-7584 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Stephanie Remington 
Subject: Check Request (2) 
Date: October 26. 2018 at 12:07:22 PM EDT 
To:
Cc: 

Good morning, Daphne, 

Please find attached a local check request from Karen for BVI Painters for PRD. The work is complete, but the balance is 
still owed. PRD was picked up by Randy and Carlos last week on 10/19/18. Please be in touch with any questions. 

Thank you, 
Stephanie 

EFTA01018494


