
From: Kyle reavis
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: Barge Ramp Pricing - Topping Slab and Fill Area 
Date: Wed, 24 Oct 2018 17:31:22 +0000 

Done 

On Wed, Oct 24, 2018, 1:07 PM J <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 
eb 

On Wed, Oct 24, 2018 at 1:03 PM Kyle reavis < > wrote: 
Good Afternoon Mr Epstein, 

JPK is lower on the barge ramp price than EB. Both include all materials and labor. JPK is pretty busy out 
here however so I was leaning towards EB to do this work and roll into the boat ramp. I can get either 
signed up today to get this rolling, please let me know your preference. Thank you! 

Very Respectfully, 

Kyle 

 Forwarded message -------
From: Kyle reavis  
Date: Tue, Oct 23, 2018 at 8:27 AM 
Subject: Barge Ramp Pricing - Topping Slab and Fill Area 
To: Richard Kahn <I >, Daphne Wallace

Good Morning, 

We have received two prices for the topping slab and fill area from Expert Builders along with JPK. My 
comments are below; 

JPK- $13,487.00 
- Listed concrete yards (correct number) 
- All materials and labor included 
- Cheaper Price ($13,487.00) 

Expert Builders- $13,700.00 
- No concrete yards listed, left it as TBD so they will owe use as many yards as it takes (not a bad thing for 
us) 
- After speaking to EB and telling them their price was outrageous they included all concrete and materials 
into their $13,700.00 price; Original price was $13,700 but did not include materials or concrete. 
- EB does still owe us a boat ramp that can be formed and poured at the same time as this area 

Rich please let me know who you think we should award this work to and I will get them rolling on this 
asap. 

Very Respectfully, 

Kyle Reavis 
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