From: Larry <| -
To: Je vacation <jeevacationf@gmail.com>, Rich Kahn *i_'-'-"
Subject: Fwd: AC5173 / KA band deposit
Date: Tue, 19 Sep 2017 14:47:39 +0000
Attachments: ac5172 sc521661 - deposit billing - kaband.pdf
Inline-Images: image001 . gif

Jeffrey

Additional deposits Gulfstream requires for KA Wifi install,,
§342.500

Is this approved to fund?

Thx
Larry

Sent from my iPad

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Cramer, Rusty" <

Date: September 19, 2017 at 10:34:07 AM EDT

Ce: "Simmons, Beth" <

= "Zimmerebner, Mike"

-

Subject: FW: AC5173 / KA band deposit

Per our telecom Larry, please see attached invoice and email below from Sep 7. This
needs to be funded as soon as possible to hold the KA slot on the managed programs
schedule. Thanks

Rusty Cramer
Regional Sales Manager
South Florida

From: Elizabeth Simmons <} N

Date: Thursday, September 7, 2017 at 1:21 PM

To: Larry Visoski JEGE Lic <[} -

cc: Mike Zimmerebner <} N NN NN . ' B:shlor, Ashley"
I .ty Crarmer <[ - ¢ Sitzman PSPM
=

Subject: RE: AC5137 / KA band deposit
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Good afternoon Larry,

We have received the additional signed proposal for AC5173 / N415LM's upcoming visit to our Savannah service facility.

We've noted the anticipated dates for the visit have changed to October 23d through January gth,

At the risk of being redundant, attached is a billing for the KA band deposit mentioned in the proposal. If Rusty has
already provided you with a similar billing, please ignore this one. If not, please initiate these funds as soon as possible.
Let us know once initiated and, if available, please provide tracking to assist us in locating them guickly to secure the
aircraft’s slot on the KA Band installation schedule.

Thanks and we will be in touch in the near future to firm up details regarding the visit,
Beth Simmons

Senior Service Center Coordinator
Gulfstream Aerospace Corporation, Savannah

From: Simmons, Beth
Sent: Wednesday, August 09, 2017 3:34 PM

To: I

ce: Zimmerebner, Mike <SG > /<hi=y \W 8ashior (I
N (-, Rusty <

Subject: AC5137 / paint in Savannah
Good afternoon Larry,

We are looking forward to the arrival of AC5173 / N415LM to our Savannah Service Center for paint scheduled October
6" — November 10™.

I have been assigned as the Service Center Coordinator for your visit. Mike Zimmerebner will be the Service Team
Manager in charge of your project.

Attached is the 550K deposit billing which, once received, will reserve your paint slot. Please let us know once these
funds are initiated and, if available, provide tracking to assist us in locating them quickly and applying them to the

correct work order.

Please feel free to contact me with any questions or concerns regarding your upcoming visit. My contact information is
below.

We will be in touch in the near future to discuss further details for your visit.
Thanks,
Beth Simmons

Senior Service Center Coordinator
Gulfstream Aerospace Corporation, Savannah
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