From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacationfwgmail.com>
To:
Subject: Re: Apt
Date: Tue, 19 Sep 2017 15:03:03 +0000

and current? ask them to calculate 35 d for remainder of term additional

On Tue, Sep 19, 2017 at 10:49 AM*_ wrote:

31 D-3700
35 D- 3850

On Tue, Sep 19, 2017 at 8:43 AM jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@ gmail.com> wrote:

Ok

Hello Jeffrey !!

[ got answer from Rita,

There are 31 D and 35 D available.

I'm waiting for the prices for them.
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