
From: J <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

To: lvjet 
Subject: Re: BBJ 

Date: Tue, 16 Oct 2018 21:02:21 +0000 

ben , as im sure you are aware the limited airplane, is under contract for under 19m. yours will take 9 
months. or more to do tanks, fuel mitigation, floor plan , galley . plus checks, and there are two others on the 
market. for under 20 . I am out of a spirit of friendship pointing this out to you. Im at the NBAA show , and 
there are few secrets in the market. 

On Tue, Oct 16, 2018 at 3:56 PM Larry Visoski c wrote: 
Jeffrey 
Gary informs that Ben's buyer Tony Robbin's canceled his contract with Ben,,, 

I received this from Ben yesterday; 

Thanks for the feedback and kind words, much appreciated! 

I checked with our team this morning and we feel the galley mods and options your looking for including the 
fuel mitigation and cabin alt mod all together should cost right under 1,0 to complete. 

For an aircraft of this size and cost that's not a big number. 

Let me know if you want more details. 

Thanks ! 

Ben Shirazi 
President 
SmartJets 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Ben Shirazi  
Date: October 15, 2018 at 8:48:33 AM EDT 
To: Larry Visoski 
Cc: Gary Anzalone 
Subject: Re: BBJ 

Thanks for the feedback and kind words, much appreciated! 

I checked with our team this morning and we feel the galley mods and options your looking for including the 
fuel mitigation and cabin alt mod all together should cost right under 1,0 to complete. 

For an aircraft of this size and cost that's not a big number. 

Let me know if you want more details. 
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Thanks ! 

Ben Shirazi 
President 
SmartJets 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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