
From: Richard Kahn a> 

To: Leah Hutton a> 

Subject: fine arts claim 

Date: Tue, 16 Oct 2018 14:22:25 +0000 

ok 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

> On Oct 16, 2018, at 10:14 AM, Leah Hutton a wrote: 

> I will try to finish it up tonight or tomorrow. Sony for the delay -I was called out of the country. 

> Sent from my iPhone 

>> On Oct 16, 2018, at 3:00 PM, Richard Kahn a wrote: 

>> any update on when we will receive paperwork 
» thank you 
>> 
>> Richard Kahn 
» HBRK Associates Inc. 

>> 
>> 

>>> On Oct 11, 2018, at 6:50 PM, Leah Hutton a> wrote: 
>» 
>>> THe carrier has authorized us to issue a Proof of Loss and Release for $1m as a net compromised amount. I 
will work on preparing the documents tomorrow. 
>» 
>» Kind regards, 

EFTA01019528



>» 
>>> Leah Hutton I McLarens 
>>> Executive General Adjuster 
>» 

>» 
>» 
>» 
>>> CONFIDENTIALITY AND PRIVILEGE NOTICE: The information contained in this message and any 
attachments may be privileged, confidential and/or exempt from disclosure under applicable law. Any views 
expressed in this message and any attachments are those of the individual sender, except where the message 
states otherwise, and in no way binds Insurers and/or their representatives. If you are not the intended recipient, 
you are hereby notified that any use, dissemination, distribution or reproduction of any information contained 
herein or attached is strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify the 
sender and destroy the original transmission and its attachments, without reading them. 
>» 
>>> Original Message 
>» From: Richard Kahn 
>>> Sent: Thursday, October 11, 2018 6:11 PM 
>» To: Leah Hutton ,,c > 
>>> Subject: Re: 
>» 
>» any updates? 
>» please advise 
>» thank you 
>» 
>» Richard Kahn 
>>> HBRK Associates Inc. 

>» 
>» 
>» 
>» 
>» 
>>» On Oct 10, 2018, at 5:49 PM, Leah Hutton wrote: 
>>» 
»» We expect their reply tomorrow. 
>>» 
»» Kind regards, 
>>» 
>>>> Leah Hutton I McLarens 
»» Executive General Adjuster 
>>» 

EFTA01019529



>> 

>>» 
>>» 
>>» 
>>>> CONFIDENTIALITY AND PRIVILEGE NOTICE: The information contained in this message and any 
attachments may be privileged, confidential and/or exempt from disclosure under applicable law. Any views 
expressed in this message and any attachments are those of the individual sender, except where the message 
states otherwise, and in no way binds Insurers and/or their representatives. If you are not the intended recipient, 
you are hereby notified that any use, dissemination, distribution or reproduction of any information contained 
herein or attached is strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify the 
sender and destroy the original transmission and its attachments, without reading them. 
>>» 
>>>> -----Original Message 
>>» From: Richard Kahn 
>>>> Sent: Wednesday, October 10 2018 5:40 PM 
»» To: Leah Hutton 
>>>> Subject: 
>>» 
»» any word back from AIG? 
»» please advise 
»» thank you 
>>» 
>>>> Richard Kahn 
>>» HBRK Associates Inc. 

EFTA01019530


