
From: J <jeevacation®gmail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Elina 
Date: Sat, 06 Oct 2018 16:27:28 +0000 
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On Sat, Oct 6, 2018 at 11:32 AM Richard Kahn < wrote: 
Ok. Please advise on amount as wires have been going out around 15th of the month. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
Phoit= 
Fax 
Cel 

On Oct 6, 2018, at 9:27 AM, J leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

we have to adjust down elina 7k per month 

please note 
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confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
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destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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