
From: Darren Indyke 
To:

Cc: Da e < 
Subject: Re:

Date: Wed, 03 Oct 2018 16:09:37 +0000 

>, LVJET 

I just checked with Joan. Still no deposit received received. Please follow up again. 
1 
DARREN K. INDYKE 
DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC 
575 Lexington Avenue. 4th Floor 
New York, 
Telephone: 
Teleco ier: 
Mobile 
email: 
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The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client 
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication 
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this 
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments. 
Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - 2018 Darren K. 
Indyke, PLLC —An rights reserved. 
*************.******************Ink It Ink It Ink It It Ink It Ink It Ink It Ink It Ink It Ink It **tint.** 

On Oct 3, 2018, at 9:39 AM, Gary Anzalone 

FYI 

Sincerely, 

Gary Anzalone - Partner 

> wrote: 

EFTA01020952



 Forwarded message  
From:  fr-" 
Date: Wed, Oct 3, 2018 at 7:10 AM 
Sub'ect: N120JE 
To: 
Cc Chuck Bierwirth Lam Visoski 
Anzalone tacey e ocher 

Morning Joan, 

Hope all is well with you. 

Gary 

You should receive a $250,000 deposit for the referenced aircraft today. Would you be so kind as to confirm 
receipt to those copied on this message? 

The parties are: 

Buyer: Dominus Aviation Ltd. 

David Thompson Buyer's representative 

Wendy and Chuck Bierwirth Buyer's acquisition agents 

Seller: JEGE 

Larry Visoski Seller's representative 

Gary Anzalone Seller's agent 

Stacey will forward a copy of the purchase agreement with the sections regarding escrow agent highlighted. 
Please let us know if there are any concerns from your side. 

Kind regards 

Wendy Bierwirth 
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