
From: J <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn • 

Subject: Re: Vita charge on Amex 
Date: Wed, 26 Sep 2018 18:11:33 +0000 

ok 

On Wed, Sep 26, 2018 at 2:07 PM, Richard Kahn < 
charge for $390 is for prescription that was called in by Dr Paduch 
is they the doctor? was medicine not covered? 
should we put in claim for medicine with medicare or united? 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

tel 
fax 
cell 

On Sep 26, 2018, at 12:41 PM, J leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

i just saw another vita health charge? they are not honest 

On Wed, Se  26, 2018 at 12:19 PM, Richard Kahn
appears is now happy with accommodations.. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

tel 
fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

wrote: 

wrote: 
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From: 
Subject: Re: Air BnB 
Date: September 26, 2018 at 12:05:33 PM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn 
Cc: Bella Klein 

< 

They moved me and it is definitely better. The smell is gone and the bathroom new!! Thank you for your 
care Rich. I will keep you posted with anything else. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Sep 26, 2018, at 1:07 PM, Richard Kahn < wrote: 

Ok please keep us posted. Thanks. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc 

On Sep 26, 2018, at 6:59 AM, > wrote: 

Hi rich. 
They said j could do so yesterday, then they said they got the date wrong and it is today, so let's see. 
Thank you so much for checking on me. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Sep 25, 2018, at 5:08 PM, Richard Kahn < wrote: 

any update if you have been moved and if so if apartment is ok.. 
please advise 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

tel 
fax 
cell 

On Sep 24, 2018, at 1:59 PM, wrote: 

EFTA01021758



M, they have offered to move me to but I have to confirm with them in the morning. I 
checked and it is newer doesn't smell, but pretty dark, but definitely a step up 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Sep 24, 2018, at 5:04 PM, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 

i wrote this online: 

Living space is not what was advertised and place smells of mold. Bathroom is unacceptable. I want 
to be moved to a better apartment or would like my money to be refunded. 
Today at 11:45 AM 

response was via text 
asking for apt number 
please advise on 

apartment number you are staying in.. 
thanks 

On Sep 24, 2018, at 10:34 AM, > wrote: 

I may. Thank you so much!! I will see what they have to offer. But in any case I want to try get 
some of the cash back for the inconvenience. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Sep 24, 2018, at 3:32 PM, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 

thank you for the update and sorry to hear it is not working out... 
please take photos and please let me know if you need me to call.. 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

tel 
fax 
cell 
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On Sep 24, 2018, at 10:30 AM, wrote: 

Dear Rich, 

The place I am in that we got off air B and B is not up to the standards represented and I will 
not let them take this money from JE unless they move me to an apartment that is. The flat 
has a very strong smell of mold. Even if I sleep with the windows open I can still smell it in 
the morning. They stated that all apartments are up to the same modern standards. This 
apartment is filthy and not up to any modern standards. I am going down to their office now. 
Just wanted to give you a heads up that they will either have to move me or they had better 
reimburse you. I will send you the photos I have taken. 

Thank you, 

• 
Sent from my iPhone 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
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return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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