
From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@grnail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Gratitude 
Date: Mon, 24 Sep 2018 20:54:59 +0000 

Monday 

On Mon, Sep 24, 2018 at 4:48 PM Richard Kahn < > wrote: 
reminder on whether we should close DB checking account with 2,350,000 or allow DB to do KYC on BV70 
LLC 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
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